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in three 100-word passages (Flesch, 1979). The word length 
is measured in syllables, while the sentence length is mea-
sured in words. Those two numbers are put into an equation 
that gives the Flesch Reading Ease, a number between zero 
and 100. The text with the readability ease of zero is almost 
impossible to read, while the text with the score 100 is the 
easiest. The Flesch Reading Ease formula was later adapted 
into the Flesch-Kincaid grade-level formula. They both use 
word and sentence length as the main measures, but have 
different weighting factors (Allen, McGhee & van Krieken, 
2005). 

The Flesch Reading Ease result is inversely related to the 
Flesch-Kincaid grade equivalent result; a text with the high 
score on the reading ease test has a lower score on the 
grade-level test. For example, a score of 5.6 means that the 
text is at the reading level of an average student in “ fth-
grade and the reading ease of that text is between 90 and 
100.

Nursing, like many other disciplines, has specialized vocabu-
lary and terms that are not frequently used in the English 
language (Allan et al., 2005). This may make it dif“ cult to 
analyze the readability of certi“ cation or licensure examina-
tions using readability tests based on the frequency of words 
in the English language. The Flesch-Kincaid readability test 
is appropriate to use for NNAAP test forms since it measures 
the length of words and sentences, and not the frequency of 
the use of these words in the English language. The read-
ability of the NNAAP test items is between the 4th and 6th 
grade levels, but no higher than the 6th grade.

Knowledge of medical and nursing terms is required in the 
nurse aide curriculum. For example, the two words urinary 
catheter are probably dif“ cult to read for the average sixth-
grader, but it should not be dif“  cult for a competent, entry-
level nurse aide candidate to understand. Since the purpose 
of the NNAAP examination is to asses the ability of nurse 
aides to assist in providing safe and effective nursing care, 
test forms do not contain any unusual words or words un-
related to care provided by nurse aides. The targeted au-
dience of the NNAAP examination, which is nurse aide/
nursing assistant candidates, is familiar with the medical ter-
minology used in the test forms.

In preparation for the Flesch-Kincaid readability analysis, all 
graphs and pictures are removed from test forms. Examina-
tion items are modi“ ed to include only words; the rest of 
the items are not modi“  ed. NNAAP subject matter experts 
(SMEs) are experienced registered nurses that receive train-
ing, education and assistance in writing concise items with 
easily readable words, using only the medical and nursing 
terminology that are necessary and appropriate for safe and 
competent, entry-level nurse aide work.

Recommendations and Future Considerations

NCSBN hopes that readability analyses will become a more 
standard practice among certi“ cation and licensure testing 
programs (Woo, Wendt & Liu, 2009). Based on an exten-
sive literature search, NCSBN recommends that SMEs who 
write NNAAP examination items should use short words and 
sentences, whenever possible. Furthermore, the length of 
each item should be no longer than two sentences, when 
possible. If the examination item is easy to read, candidates 
can put more emphasis on the nurse aide knowledge and 
content being measured in each item. However, nurse aide 
educators should not feel that they must adhere to these 
standards when they write questions for their students. It is 
completely acceptable to write questions that require great-
er reading ability, insofar as the students are accustomed to 
reading questions that have higher readability levels. Test 
developers and item writers should be mindful of the read-
ability requirements of examination items and use readabil-
ity assessments as an adjunct, not a barrier, to the successful 
assessment of otherwise competent candidates.
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